
(259) 

 

Haryana Government Gazette 
EXTRAORDINARY 

Published by Authority 
© Govt.  of   Haryana  

30-2020/Ext.]   CHANDIGARH,  WEDNESDAY,  FEBRUARY  26,  2020  (PHALGUNA 7,   1941  SAKA)              

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT 

Notification 

The 26th February, 2020 

No. 08-HLA of 2020/19/3622.— The Haryana Panchayati Raj (Amendment) Bill, 2020, is 

hereby published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and 

Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :- 

 Bill No.  08- HLA of 2020                 

 

THE HARYANA PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020 

A 

BILL 

further to amend the Haryana Panchayati Raj Act, 1994. 

 Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-first Year of the 

Republic of India as follows :- 

 

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Panchayati Raj (Amendent) Act, 2020. Short title. 

2. In section 2 of the Haryana Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (hereinafter called the principal Act),- 

(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

‘(ii)  “Adult” means a person, male or female or transgender, who has attained the 

age of eighteen years;’; 

(b) after clause (lxx), the following clause shall be inserted namely:- 

(lxx-a) “Ward Sabha” means a body consisting of persons registered in the voters list 

of each constituency of each Gram Panchayat.”.   

Amendment of 

Section 2 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

3. For sub-section (1) of section 3 of the principal Act, the following sub-section shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

“(1) Every Gram Panchayat, Panchayat Samiti and Zila Parishad unless sooner dissolved 

under any law for the time being in force, shall continue for a period of five years from 

the date of notification issued by the State Election Commission in which elected 

representative are notified.”. 

Amendment of 

section 3 of 
Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 



 

 

260 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 

Insertion of 
section 3A in 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

4. After section 3 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:- 

   “3A. Ward Sabha.- (1)  Subject to the general orders of the Government, every Ward 

 Sabha shall meet at least once in six months. 

(2) The quorum for the meeting of a Ward Sabha shall be not less than one-tenth of the 

total number of members of the Ward Sabha or twenty members, whichever is less. 

(3) The Ward Sabha shall, exercise the following powers and discharge the following 

functions in such manner, as may be prescribed, namely:- 

(a) generate proposals and determine the priority of schemes and development 

programme to be implemented in the area of the Ward Sabha and forward the 

same to the Gram Sabha for inclusion in Gram Panchayat development plan; 

(b) identify the most eligible persons from the area of Ward Sabha for beneficiary 

oriented schemes on the basis of criteria fixed and prepare list of eligible 

beneficiaries in the order of priority and forward the same to the Gram 

Panchayat; 

(c) verify the eligibility of persons getting various kinds of welfare assistance from 

Government such as pensions and subsidies; 

(d) get the information from the officers of the Gram Panchayat as to the services 

they shall render and the works they propose to do in the succeeding period of 

six months after the meeting of the Ward Sabha; 

(e) get information from the Gram Panchayat on the rational of every decision of 

the Gram Panchayat concerning the area of the Ward Sabha; 

(f) get information from the Gram Panchayat on the follow up action taken on the 

decisions of the Ward Sabha; 

(g) provide and mobilize voluntary labour and contributions in cash and kind for 

development work and supervise such development works through volunteer 

teams; 

(h) make efforts to ensure that the members of Ward Sabha pay taxes and repay 

loans to the Gram Panchayat; 

(i) suggest the location of streetlights, street or community water taps, public wells, 

public sanitation units, irrigation facilities and such other public amenity 

schemes within the area of the Ward Sabha; 

(j) identify the deficiencies in the water supply and street lighting arrangements in 

the area of Ward Sabha and suggest remedial measures; 

(k) impart awareness on matters of public interest such as cleanliness, preservation 

of the environment and prevention of pollution; 

(l) assist the employees of the Gram Panchayat in sanitation arrangements in the 

area of Ward Sabha and render voluntary service in the removal of garbage; 

(m) promote programme of adult education within the area of Ward Sabha; 

(n) assist the activities of public health centers in the area of the Ward Sabha 

especially in disease prevention and family welfare and to prevent incidence of 

epidemics and natural calamities; 

(o) promote harmony and unity among various groups of people in the area of the 

Ward Sabha and to arrange cultural festivals and sports meets to give expression 

to the talents of the people of the locality; and 

(p) exercise such other powers and discharge such other functions, as may be 

prescribed. 

(4) The procedure for convening and conducting the meetings of the Ward Sabha shall be 

such, as may be prescribed. 

(5) Every meeting of a Ward Sabha shall be presided over by the member of the Gram 

Panchayat elected from the area of the concerned Ward Sabha and in his absence, by 

any other member of the Gram Panchayat to be nominated by the Sarpanch. 

(6) All resolutions in respect of any issue in the meeting of the Ward Sabha shall be passed 

by a majority of the members present and voting.”. 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 261 

 

5. In section 11 of the principal Act,- 

(i) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:- 

“(7A) For any general meeting of the Gram Sabha, one-tenth of the members 

of Gram Sabha or three hundred members, whichever is less, shall form a quorum.”; 

(ii) in sub-section (8), in the end, the words and signs shall be added, namely:- 

“In case such functionary does not attend the meeting, without reasonable cause 

the Gram Sachiv shall report his absence to the Government.”. 

Amendment of 

section 11 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

6. For section 17 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

“17.  Modification or cancellation of resolution.- (1) A Gram Panchayat may 

modify, amend, vary or cancel its resolution within a period of three months from the date 

of its passing: 

Provided that such resolution for modifying, amending, varying or cancelling 

thereof shall be supported by three-fourth of the total number of panches of such Gram 

Panchayat. 

(2) In case a resolution is required to be passed by a Gram Panchayat for sale, lease or 

exchange of its land, in which approval of the Government is required, the proposal shall 

be placed before Gram Sabha for its suggestion and approval before a resolution is passed 

by the Gram Panchayat and is forwarded to the Government for approval. 

(3) No resolution of a Gram Panchayat shall be modified, amended, varied or cancelled 

by a Gram Panchayat after the expiry of a period of three months, except with the prior 

approval of Government. 

(4) The Gram Panchayat shall act upon its resolution within a period of three months 

from the date of passing of the resolution or approval by the competent authority, if 

required.”. 

Substitution of 

section 17 of 
Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

7. In sub-section (1) of section 20 of the principal Act,- 

(i) for the sign “.” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted; and 

(ii) the following proviso shall be added, namely:-  

“Provided that the Gram Panchayat shall prepare a report of the work not done, 

during the previous year and also record the reasons.”. 

Amendment of 

section 20 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

8. In sub-section (4) of section 24 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 24 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

9. In section 25 of the principal Act,- 

(i) for clause (s), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(s) regulate and prohibit burning of residuals of crops;”; 

(ii) after clause (s), the following clause shall be added, namely:- 

“(u) specify the manner and the measures to regulate water conservation in the 

village; 

(v) regulate the management of stray cattle; 

(w) prohibit open defecation in village.”. 

Amendment of 
section 25 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

10. For section 27 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “27. Penalty for disobedience of a special or general order of Gram Panchayat.- Any person 

who disobeys an order passed under sections 24 or 25 by the Gram Panchayat, shall be liable to a 

penalty of minimum one hundred rupees which may extend to maximum two thousand rupees and if 

the breach is continuous with a further penalty which may extend to one hundred rupees for everyday 

after the first breach during which the breach continues: 

 Provided that the penalty for recurring breach shall not exceed the sum of ten thousand rupees: 

 Provided further that if the amount of penalty is not deposited within a period of thirty days, 

it shall be recovered as arrear of land revenue within six months.”. 

Substitution of 

section 27 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 



 

 

262 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 

Amendment of 
section 28 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

11. In section 28 of the principal Act, for the word “Director”, the words “concerned Deputy 

Commissioner” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 35 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

12. In sub-section (3) of section 35 of the principal Act, for the words “fifty rupees”, the words 

“five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 
section 43 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

13. In sub-section (2) of section 43 of the principal Act, for the words “as may be prescribed”, the 

words “of fifty rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 54 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

14. In sub-section (1) of section 54 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the 

words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

 

Amendment of 
section 125 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

15. In sub-section (4) of section 125 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 171 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

16. In clause (b) of section 171 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 
section 172 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

17. In sub-section (1) of section 172 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 176 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

18. After sub-section (5) of section 176 of the principal Act, the following sub-section shall be 

added, namely:- 

“(6) Any person, aggrieved by an order passed by the civil court under sub-section (4), 

may within a period of thirty days from the date of such order, prefer an appeal to the District 

Judge having ordinary jurisdiction in the area. The District Judge may after hearing the appeal, 

confirm, vary or reverse the order. The decision of the District Judge shall be final.”. 

Amendment of 

section 180 of 
Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

19. In sub-section (2) of section 180 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, 

the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

 

Amendment of 
section 181 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

20. In sub-section (2) of section 181 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, 

the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 182 of 
Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

21. In sub-section (3) of section 182 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, 

the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 
section 183 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

22. In sub-section (2) of section 183 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 184 of 
Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

23. In sub-section (3) of section 184 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, 

the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 185 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

24. In sub-section (1) of section 185 of the principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”, 

the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 
section 186 of 

Haryana Act 11 

of 1994. 

25. In sub-section (1) of section 186 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 263 

 

26. In sub-section (2) of section 187 of the principal Act,- 

(i) in clause (a), for the words “rupees one thousand”, the words “ten thousand rupees” 

shall be substituted; 

(ii) in clause (b), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees” 

shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

section 187 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

27. In section 243 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “five 

thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 

Amendment of 
section 243 of 

Haryana Act 11 
of 1994. 

 

  



 

 

264 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

1. To prepare Gram Panchayat Development Plan, meetings of Ward Sabha and Gram Sabha are required to be 

convened; therefore, the quorum, manner and procedure to convene their meetings are necessary to be laid.  

2. It was considered necessary to fix the date of commencement of the term of five years of the Panchayati Raj 

Institutions from the date of notification issued by the State Election Commission instead of their first meeting. 

3. It was considered necessary to ensure that Gram Panchayats do not withdraw/cancel their resolutions after a 

period of three months of passing of the resolution so as to ensure certainty and finality of decision making in 

the Gram Panchayats. It is also required to ascertain that Gram Panchayats are acting upon their resolutions in a 

time bound manner. 

4. To bring in more transparency and participation of the people in decision making, proposal for sale, lease or 

exchange of land is required to be placed before Gram Sabha for its approval before seeking approval of the 

Government. 

5. Besides the various activities being regulated by the Gram Panchayats, some other activities i.e. stray cattle, 

open defecation free, burning of residuals of crops and water conservation are also required to be regulated and 

managed by the Gram Panchayats. Further, it was considered necessary that remedy of appeal against the order 

of Gram Panchayat may be made available with the authority at district headquarter instead of State Headquarter.  

6. It was considered necessary to increase the amount of penalty in case of violation of various provisions of the 

Act to make it serve as an effective deterrent.   

7. Section 176 of the Haryana Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 does not currently provide that the order passed by the 

civil court in an election petition shall be the final order. Nor does it have any provision of appeal against the 

order passed by the civil court. Therefore, it is necessary to make a provision of appeal against the order passed 

by the civil court in an election petition. 

  Hence, this Bill. 

 

 DUSHYANT CHAUTALA, 

 Deputy Chief Minister,  

 Haryana. 

     

 

Chandiarh:  R. K. NANDAL, 

The 26th February, 2020.  Secretary.  



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 265 

 
 [izkf/kd`r vuqokn ] 

2020 dk fo/ks;d la[;k 8&,p0,y0,0 

gfj;k.kk iapk;rh jkt ¼la’kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2020 

gfj;k.kkk iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 

dks vkxs la’kksf/kr djus ds fy, 

fo/ks;d 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds bdgRrjosas o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa  

;g vf/kfu;fer gks %& 

1- ;g vf/kfu;e gfj;k.kk iapk;rh jkt ¼la’kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2020] dgk tk ldrk gSA laf{kIr ukeA 

2- gfj;k.kk iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼ftls] blesa] blds ckn] ewy vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½ 

dh /kkjk 2 esa]& 

¼d½ [k.M ¼ii½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr [k.M izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~~%& 

*¼ii½  ßo;Ldß ls vfHkizk; gS] dksbZ O;fDRk] iq:"k ;k efgyk ;k Vªkalts.Mj] ftlus 

vBkjg o"kZ dh vk;q iwjh dj yh gks(*( 

¼[k½ [k.M ¼lxx½ ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr [k.M] j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 

*¼lxx&d½ ßOkkMZ lHkkß ls vfHkizk; gS] izR;sd xzke iapk;r ds izR;sd fuokZpu&{ks= dh 

ernkrk lwph esa iath—r O;fDr;ksa ls feydj cuus okyk dksbZ fudk;A*A 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 2 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

3- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh 

tk,xh] vFkkZr~%&  

ß¼1½  izR;sd xzke iapk;r] iapk;r lfefr rFkk ftyk ifj"kn~] tc rd ml le; ykxw fdlh 

fof/k ds v/khu igys fo?kfVr ugha dh tkrh gS] rks jkT; fuokZpu vk;ksx }kjk tkjh dh 

xbZ vf/klwpuk] ftleas fuokZfpr izfrfuf/k vf/klwfpr fd, x, gSa] dh frfFk ls ik¡p o"kZ 

dh vof/k ds fy, cuh jgsxhAßA 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 3 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

4- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[kh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 

ß3d- okMZ lHkk-&¼1½ ljdkj ds lkekU; vkns’kksa ds v/;/khu] izR;sd okMZ lHkk Ng ekl 

esa de ls de ,d ckj vf/kos’ku djsxhA 

¼2½ fdlh okMZ lHkk ds vf/kos’ku ds fy, x.kiwfrZ] okMZ lHkk ds lnL;ksa dh dqy la[;k dk 

,d cVk nl ;k chl lnL;ksa] tks Hkh de gks] ls de ugha gksxhA 

¼3½ okMZ lHkk] ,slh jhfr] tks fofgr dh tk,] esa fuEufyf[kr ’kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx rFkk  

fuEufyf[kr —R;ksa dk fuoZgu djsxh] vFkkZr~%& 

¼d½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= esa ykxw dh tkus okyh ;kstukvksa vkSj fodkl dk;ZØeksa ds izLrko 

rS;kj djuk vkSj ojh;rk fu/kkZfjr djuk vkSj xzke iapk;r fodkl ;kstuk esa 

’kkfey djus ds fy, mls xzke lHkk dks Hkstuk(                    

¼[k½ fu;r ekun.M ds vk/kkj ij ykHknk;h mUeq[k ;kstukvksa ds fy, okMZ lHkk ds {ks= 

ls lcls vf/kd ik= O;fDr;ksa dh igpku djuk vkSj ojh;rk ds vuqØe esa ik= 

ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dh lwph rS;kj djuk vkSj mls xzke iapk;r dks Hkstuk( 

¼x½ ljdkj ls fofHkUu izdkj dh dY;k.k lgk;rk tSls isa’ku vkSj vkfFkZd&lgk;rk 

izkIr djus okys O;fDr;ksa dh ik=rk lR;kfir djuk( 

¼?k½ xzke iapk;r ds vf/kdkfj;ksa ls mu }kjk okMZ lHkk dh cSBd ds ckn Ng ekl dh 

mŸkjorhZ vof/k esa nh tkus okyh lsokvksa vkSj fd, tkus okys izLrkfor dk;ksZa ds 

ckjs esa lwpuk izkIr djuk( 

¼³½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= ls lacaf/kr xzke iapk;r ds ;qfDrewyd izR;sd fu.kZ; ij xzke 

iapk;r ls lwpuk izkIr djuk( 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 esa 

/kkjk 3d dk j[kk 

tkukA 



 

 

266 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 

 ¼p½ okMZ lHkk ds fu.kZ;ksa ij dh tkus okyh vuqorhZ dkjZokbZ ij xzke iapk;r ls lwpuk 

izkIr djuk( 

¼N½ fodkl dk;Z ds fy, LoSfPNd Je vkSj udn esa rFkk vuqxzgiwoZd va’knku miyC/k 

djokuk rFkk ykecUnh djokuk vkSj LoSfPNd Vhe ds ek/;e ls ,sls fodkl dk;ksaZ 

dk Ik;Zos{k.k djokuk( 

¼t½ ;g lqfuf’fpr djus ds fy, iz;kl djuk fd okMZ lHkk ds lnL;] xzke iapk;r 

dks djksa dk Hkqxrku vkSj _.kksa dk iquHkZqxrku djrs gSa( 

¼>½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= ds Hkhrj xyh dh cfŸk;ksa ;k lkeqnkf;d ty uyksa] lkoZtfud 

dqavksa] lkoZtfud LoPNrk bdkbZ;ksa] flapkbZ lqfo/kkvksa vkSj ,slh vU; lkoZtfud 

lq[k&lqfo/kk ;kstukvksa ds fy, voLFkku lq>kuk( 

¼¥½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= esa ty vkiwfrZ vkSj xyh izdk’k izcU/ku esa dfe;ksa dh igpku 

djuk rFkk lq/kkjkRed mik; lq>kuk( 

¼V½ lkoZtfud fgr tSls fd LoPNrk] Ik;kZoj.k laj{k.k rFkk iznw"k.k fuokj.k ds ekeyksa 

ij tkx:drk iznku djuk( 

¼B½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= esa LoPNrk izcU/ku esa xzke iapk;r ds deZpkfj;ksa dh lgk;rk 

djuk vkSj dwMs+&djdV dks gVkus esa LoSfPNd lsok nsuk( 

¼M½ xzke lHkk ds {ks= ds Hkhrj izkS<+ f’k{kk ds dk;ZØe izksUur djuk( 

¼<½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= ds Hkhrj tu LokLF; dsUnzksa dh xfrfof/k;ksa fo’ks"k :Ik ls chekjh 

dh jksdFkke vkSj ifjokj dY;k.k vkSj egkekjh rFkk izk—frd vkinkvksa ls mRiUu 

gksus okyh ?kVukvksa dks jksdus esa lgk;rk djuk( 

¼.k½ okMZ lHkk ds {ks= esa O;fDr;ksa ds fofHkUu xzqi ds e/; leUo; vkSj ,drk dks c<+kok 

nsuk vkSj LFkkuh; O;fDr;ksa dh izfrHkk dks vfHkO;fDr iznku djus ds fy,  

lkaL—frd mRloksa vkSj [ksyksa dk vk;kstu djuk( rFkk 

¼r½ ,slh vU; ’kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djuk vkSj ,sls vU; —R;ksa dk fuoZgu djuk] tks 

fofgr fd, tk,aA 

¼4½ okMZ lHkk ds vf/kos’kuksa dks vk;ksftr vkSj lapkfyr djus dh izfØ;k ,slh gksxh] tks fofgr 

dh tk,A 

¼5½ fdlh okMZ lHkk ds izR;sd vf/kos’ku dh v/;{krk lacaf/kr okMZ lHkk ds {ks= ls fuokZfpr 

xzke iapk;r ds lnL; }kjk vkSj mldh vuqifLFkfr esa] ljiap }kjk euksuhr fd, tkus 

okys xzke iapk;r ds fdlh vU; lnL; }kjk dh tk,xhA 

¼6½ okMZ lHkk ds vf/kos’ku esa fdlh eqn~~ns ds lEcU/k esa lHkh ladYi mifLFkr lnL;ksa ds ernku 

ds cgqer }kjk ikfjr fd, tk,axsAßA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 11 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

5-    ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 11 esa]&   

¼i½ mi&/kkjk ¼7½ ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk j[kh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 

      ß¼7d½ xzke lHkk ds fdlh lkekU; vf/kos’ku ds fy, x.kiwfrZ] xzke lHkk ds lnL;ksa dk ,d  

cVk nl vFkok rhu lkS lnL;ksa] tks Hkh de gks] ls gksxh 

¼ii½ mi&/kkjk 8 esa] vUr esa] fuEufyf[kr ’kCn rFkk fpg~u tksMs+ tk,axs] vFkkZr~~%& 

      ß;fn ,sls vf/kdkjh fdlh ;qfDr;qDr dkj.k ds fcuk vf/kos’ku esa mifLFkr ugha gksrs gSa] rks 

xzke lfpo mudh vuqifLFkfr dh fjiksVZ ljdkj dks djsxkAßA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk  

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 17 dk 

izfrLFkkiuA 

6- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 17 ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr /kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 

ß17 ladYi dk mikUrj.k ;k jn~~ndj.k-&¼1½ dksbZ Hkh xzke iapk;r blds ladYi dks ikfjr 

djus dh frfFk ls rhu ekl dh vof/k ds Hkhrj mikUrfjr] la’kksf/kr] ifjofrZr ;k jn~n dj ldrh 

gS% 

ijUrq ,slk ladYi] mlds mikarj.k] la’kks/ku] ifjorZu ;k jn~~ndj.k ds fy,] ,slh xzke 

iapk;r ds iapksa dh dqy la[;k dk rhu cVk pkj ls lefFkZr gksxkA 

¼2½ ;fn fdlh xzke iapk;r }kjk mldh Hkwfe ds foØ;] iV~Vs ij nsus ;k fofue;] ftlesa 

ljdkj dk vuqeksnu visf{kr gS] ds fy, ladYi ikfjr fd;k tkuk visf{kr gS] rks ladYi 

xzke iapk;r }kjk ikfjr djus ls iwoZ izLrko xzke lHkk ds lEeq[k blds lq>ko vkSj 

vuqeksnu ds fy, j[kk tk,xk vkSj mls ljdkj dks vuqeksnu ds fy, Hkstk tk,xkA         



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 267 

 

¼3½ fdlh iapk;r dk dksbZ Hkh ladYi] ljdkj ds iwoZ vuqeksnu ds fcuk] rhu ekl dh vof/k 

dh lekfIr ds ckn fdlh xzke iapk;r }kjk mikUrfjr] la’kksf/kr] ifjofRkZr vFkok jn~n 

ugha fd;k tk,xkA 

¼4½ xzke iapk;r ladYi ds ikfjr gksus vFkok l{ke izkf/kdkjh ds vuqeksnu] ;fn visf{kr gks] 

dh frfFk ls rhu ekl dh vof/k ds Hkhrj blds ladYi ij dk;Zokgh djsxhAßA 

 

7- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 20 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa]& 

¼i½ vUr esa fo|eku ßAß fpg~~u ds LFkku ij] ß%ß fpg~~u izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( rFkk 

¼ii½ fUkEufyf[kr ijUrqd tksM+k tk,xk] vFkkZr~~%& 

ßijUrq xzke iapk;r iwoZ o"kZ ds nkSjku fu"ikfnr dk;Z dh fjiksVZ rS;kj djsxh rFkk 

dkj.k Hkh vfHkfyf[kr djsxhAßA 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 20 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

8- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 24 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p 

gtkj :Ik;sß izfrLFkkfir fd;s tk,axsA  

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 24 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

9- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25 esa]& 

¼i½ [k.M ¼/k½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr [k.M izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~~%& 

ß¼/k½ Qlyksa ds vo’ks"kksa dks tykus dk fofu;eu vkSj izfr"ks/k dj ldrh gS(ß( 

¼ii½ [k.M ¼/k½ ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr [k.M tksM+s tk,axs] vFkkZr~~%& 

ß¼u½ xk¡o esa ty laj{k.k dh jhfr fofufnZ"V dj ldrh gS vkSj fofu;fer djus ds 

fy, mik; dj ldrh gS( 

¼i½ vkokjk Ik’kqvksa ds izcU/ku dks fofu;fer dj ldrh gS( 

¼Q½ xk¡o esa [kqys esa eyR;kx dks izfr"ks/k dj ldrh gSAßA  

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 25 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

10- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 27 ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr /kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~~%& 

ß27- xzke iapk;r ds fdlh fo’ks"k ;k lk/kkj.k vkns’k dh voKk ds fy, ’kkfLr-& dksbZ 

O;fDr] tks xzke iapk;r }kjk /kkjk 24 ;k 25 ds v/khu ikfjr fdlh vkns’k dh voKk djrk gS] 

rks U;wure ,d lkS :Ik,] tks vf/kdre nkS lkS :Ik, rd c<+k;k tk ldrk gS] vkSj ;fn Hkax 

pkyw jgrk gS] rks vfrfjDr ’kkfLr] tks ,sls izR;sd fnu] ftlds nkSjku izFke Hkax ds Ik’pkr~~ Hkax 

pkyw jgrk gS] ds fy, ,d lkS :Ik;s rd c<+k;k tk ldrh gS] dh ’kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk%  

ijUrq vkorhZ Hkax ds fy, ’kkfLr nl gtkj :Ik, dh /ku jkf’k ls vf/kd ugha gksxh% 

ijUrq ;g vkSj fd ;fn ’kkfLr dh jkf’k rhl fnu dh vof/k ds Hkhrj tek ugha djokbZ 

tkrh gS] rks ;g Hkw&jkTkLo ds cdk;k ds :Ik esa Ng ekl ds Hkhrj olwy dh tk,xhAßA                  

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 27 dk 

izfrLFkkiuA 

11- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 28 esa] ßfuns’kdß ’kCn ds LFkku ij] ßlEc) mik;qDrß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir 

fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 28 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

12- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 35 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ßipkl :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p lkS 

:Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 35 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

13- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 43 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ß;Fkkfofgrß ’kCn ds LFkku ij] ßipkl :Ik;s 

dhß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA  

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 43 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

14- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 54 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ eas] ßik¡p lkS :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ß,d gtkj 

:Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA  

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 54 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

15- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 125 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] ßik¡p lkS :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p 

gtkj :Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 dh 

/kkjk 125 dk 

la’kks/kuA 
 



 

 

268 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 171 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

16-    ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 171 ds [k.M ¼[k½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj 

:Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 172 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

17- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 172 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßik¡p lkS :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj 

:Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 176 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

18- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 176 dh mi&/kkjk ¼5½ ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk tksM+h tk,xh] 

vFkkZr~%& 

ß¼6½ mi&/kkjk ¼4½ ds v/khu flfoy U;k;ky; }kjk ikfjr vkns’k ls O;fFkr dksbZ O;fDr] 

,sls vkns’k dh frfFk ls rhl fnu dh vof/k ds Hkhrj] {ks= esa lkekU; vf/kdkfjrk j[kus okys ftyk 

U;k;k/kh’k dks vihy dj ldrk gSA ftyk U;k;k/kh’k] vihy dh lquokbZ ds ckn] vkns’k dks iq"V] 

ifjofRkZr vFkok myV ldrk gSA ftyk U;k;k/kh’k dk fu.kZ; vfUre gksxkAßA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 180 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

19- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 180 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p 

gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 181 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

20- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 181 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p 

gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 182 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

21- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 182 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p 

gtkj :Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 183 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

22- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 183 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ßik¡p lkS :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj 

:Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 184 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

23- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 184 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p 

gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 185 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

24- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 185 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßnks gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj 

:Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 186 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

25- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 186 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßik¡p lkS :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj 

:Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 187 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

26- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 187 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa]& 

¼i½  [k.M ¼d½ esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßnl gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir 

fd, tk,axsA 

¼ii½  [k.M ¼[k½ esa] ßik¡p lkS :Ik;sß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj :Ik;sß ’kCn izfrLFkkfir 

fd, tk,axsA 

1994 ds 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 11 

dh /kkjk 243 dk 

la’kks/kuA 

27- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 243 esa] ß,d gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ßik¡p gtkj :Ik,ß ’kCn 

izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  FEB.  26,  2020  (PHGN.  7,  1941  SAKA) 269 

 
mn~ns';ksa rFkk dkj.kksa dk fooj.k 

1- xzke iapk;r fodkl ;kstuk dks rS;kj djus ds fy, okMZ lHkk rFkk xzke lHkk dh cSBds djokuk vo’;d gS] blfy, 

budh cSBdksa dks vk;ksftr djus ds fy, dksje] çfØ;k rFkk <ax fu/kkZfjr djuk vko’;d gSA 

2- iapk;rh jkt laLFkkvksa ds 5 lky ds dk;Zdky dk vkjEHk mudh çFke cSBd dh ctk; jkT; pquko vk;ksx }kjk tkjh 

vk/kh lwpuk dh frfFk ls fuf’pr djuk vko’;d le>k x;k gSA 

3- xzke iapk;r ds fu.kZ;ksa dh vfUre fLFkfr rFkk lR;rrk lqfuf’pr djus ds fy, ;g vko’;d le>k x;k fd xzke 

iapk;r vius çLrko dks ikfjr djus ds 3 ekl Ik’pkr~ mUgsa okfil@jn~n u djsaA ;g lqfuf:pr djuk Hkh vko’;d 

le>k x;k fd xzke iapk;rsa muds çLrko ij le;c) rjhds ls dk;Zokgh djsaA  

4- fu.kZ;ksa esa yksxksa dh lgHkkfxrk rFkk ikjnf’kZrk ykus ds fy, Hkwfe dh fcØh] iV~Vs rFkk rcknys ds fy, çLrko jkT; 

ljdkj dks vuqeksnu ds fy, Hkstus ls iwoZ xzke lHkk ds le{k j[kuk vko’;d le>k x;kA 

5- xzke iapk;rksa }kjk dbZ vU; xfrfof/k;ksa ds vfrfjDr dqN vU; xfrfof/k;ka tSls vkokjk Ik’kqvksa] [kqys esa 'kkSp eqDr] 

Qlyksa ds vo’ks"k tykus rFkk ty laj{k.k dks Hkh xzke iapk;rksa }kjk fofu;fer rFkk çcfU/kr fd;k tkuk vko’;d 

gSA blds vfrfjDr ;g vko’;d le>k x;k fd xzke iapk;rksa ds vkns’kksa ds fo:/k vihy dh lqfo/kk jkT; ljdkj 

dh ctk; ftyk eq[;ky; ij fLFkr çkf/kdkjh ds le{k miyC/k djok nh tk;saA  

6- vf/kfu;e ds dbZ çko/kkuksa ds myaX?ku dh n’kk esa tqekZuk jkf’k dks c<+kuk vko’;d le>k x;k rkfd ;g çHkkoh 

fuokjd ds :Ik esa dke dj ldsA 

7- orZeku esa gfj;k.kk iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 /kkjk 176 esa çko/kku ugha gS fd pquko ;kfpdk esa fnokuh U;k;ky; 

}kjk ikfjr vkns’k vfUre gksxkA fnokuh U;k;ky; }kjk ikfjr vkns’k ds fo:/k vihy nk;j djus dk Hkh çko/kku 

ugha gSA blfy, ;g vko’;d le>k x;k fd pquko ;kfpdk esa fnokuh U;k;ky; }kjk ikfjr vkns’k ds fo:/k vihy 

dk çko/kku dj fn;k tk;saA 

 vr% ;g fcy çLrqr gSA                                                       

 

 nq";ar pkSVkyk] 

 mi&eq[; eU=h] 

 gfj;k.kkA  

____________ 

p.Mhx<+ : vkj0 ds0 ukany] 

fnukad 26 Qjojh] 2020- lfpoA  

    

 

 

 

   

8708—H.V.S.—H.G.P., Pkl. 

 


